
 STUDENT/PARENT AGREEMENT AND PERMISSION FOR INTERNET ACCESS  

 
 

 
All use of the Internet must be consistent with the District's goal of promoting educational excellence by 
facilitating resource sharing, innovation, and communication. This Agreement Form does not attempt to 
state all required or proscribed behavior by users. However, some specific examples are provided. 
Students will be subject to loss of privileges, disciplinary action, and/or appropriate legal action for 
any violation of this Agreement or Board Policy 6:235, or for any inappropriate use of the Internet or 
network. The signatures below are legally binding and indicate that the student and the student's 
parent/guardian have read this Agreement carefully and understand its significance.  
 
By signing this document, guardians and students indicate they understand and will abide by the 
Agreement and Permission for Internet Access. They further understand that if the student commits any 
violation, the student's access privileges may be revoked, and the student will be subject to disciplinary 
action and/or appropriate legal action. In consideration for using the District's Internet connection and 
having access to public networks, guardians and students hereby release East Aurora School District 131 
and its Board of Education members, employees, and agents from any claims and damages arising from 
use of, or inability to use, the Internet.  
 
Although East Aurora School District 131 provides and operates a technology protection measure 
(filtering) with respect to any of its computers with Internet access, by signing this document guardians 
and students recognize that it is impossible to fully eliminate or restrict access to all controversial or 
inappropriate material. Parents and students also understand that the District cannot guarantee that 
“filtering” software will be totally effective or that a student will not have access to materials that may 
be defamatory, inaccurate, offensive, or otherwise inappropriate in the school setting. Guardians and 
students will hold harmless East Aurora School District 131, its employees, agents, and Board of 
Education members, for any harm caused by materials or software obtained via the network. Guardians 
accept full responsibility for supervision if and when my child's use is not in a school setting. The 
undersigned have discussed the terms of this Agreement.  

 
Students will not be allowed to use the District's internet until signed permission is given to 
school.  

 
 

SELECT ONE: 

 We request that the student be allowed access to the District's Internet.  
   

 We do NOT wish the student to have access to the District’s Internet  
 

Date ____________    Student ID __________________  

Student name (Please print): __________________________________________________________ 

Guardian name (Please print): _________________________________________________________ 

Guardian signature __________________________________________________________________ 
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